
K A Y D E E S A Y F A . C O . U K

ROLLER BLINDS 
SOLUTION

KaydeeSayfa are able to offer a range of 
roller blind solutions for any large scale 
construction project. Utilising our +35 
years of industry experience, our team 
are able to provide on time & on budget 
project delivery. Our expansive supply 
chain, enables our team to meet your 
project's unique specification and design 
needs without compromise.

The durable design, flexibility, and ease 
of operation make roller blinds the 
preferred shading solution for most large 
scale commercial constuction projects. 
These systems provide versatile shading 
solutions with a range of fabrics including 
screen, dim-out and blackout fabrics. The 
array of colour selection and textures 
make it a popular choice for interior 
designers and decorators.

SIMPLE AND EASY TO OPERATE 
CONTROLS

DURABLE AND ROBUST 
MECHANISMS

FLEXIBILITY IN SIZE TO MATCH ANY 
WINDOW OR APERTURE

REMOTE, SWITCH AND SMART 
SENSOR OPERATING OPTIONS

WIDE RANGE OF COMPATIBLE 
FABRIC OPTIONS

   Roller Blind Systems at First Street Manchester

http://www.kaydeeblinds.com


KAYDEESAYFA

MAX WIDTH: 

Up to 4500mm (approx 
 
MAX DROP: 

Up to 5000mm (approx) 
 
APPLICATIONS:

DESIGN OPTIONS: 

Colour matched hardware - bottom bar, 
brackets and fixing covers. 
 
CURTAIN OPTIONS: 

	 Manual Chain (Nylon, Metal)

	 Electric (Remote, Switch)

	 Smart (Sensor, BMS controlled)

	 Crank (Fixed, Detachable)

01509 502 155

ENQUIRIES@KAYDEESAYFA.CO.UK

   Roller Blind Systems at John Moores University

http://www.kaydeeblinds.com
mailto:enquiries@kaydeeblinds.com

